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Maŋnyɛ Mensima Clerk, is an 
Academic-Practitioner of 
African Female Puberty Rites, 
Sexual and Reproductive 
Health, and HIV Prevention 
and Care. Maŋnyɛ Mensima 
is a Career Philanthropist  and 
champions the cause of 
Menstrual Health and is 
involved in the advancement 

of Menstrual Science as a 
researcher, inventor and 
educator.  Maŋnyɛ Mensima 
utilizes technology to creates 
products and services from 
her research and clinical work 
and to disseminate her 
academic work to the 
masses. From repackaging 
ancient customary rites for 

virtual training, to reinventing 
menstrual health products 
and designing mobile health 
platforms,  Maŋnyɛ Mensima 
is an enterprising Traditional 
Leader, with a unique 
approach to royal life.
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